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importance of detecting different types of information, the understanding that all information has 
value depending on how it is used, and the fact that information users are in control of how 
information is used. This helped to stress SLOs 2 & 3, and I was able to gather in class that 
students were grasping the concepts of differing types of information and ethical information 
use.  
 
I have developed a strong relationship with Prof. Rocco. He expressed after class that he had 
learned quite a bit of useful information from my instruction session. I plan to reach out to Prof. 
Rocco to discuss the work of his students and get feedback on how the students performed in this 
course with library instruction compared to his BUS 140 course in Spring 2018 that did not have 
library instruction. 
 
Based on your experience teaching this class and any assessment of student work you were 
able to do, what can you change next time to improve how you teach it? Or, what was 
successful that you want to be sure to do again the next time you teach it? 
 
The instruction session was designed to create foundational research skills at the BUS 100-level 
so that through future library instruction I can work to build upon those skills in other courses. 
This opportunity to reach students at the beginning of their coursework in the field of business 
was a success because the focus was on emphasizing the research process, the importance of 
different types of information, and the responsibility to use information ethically. Students were 
also introduced to several business resources, specifically databases and where to locate 
company/industry profiles and basic financial information for their projects. 
 
 
Information Literacy Program Learning Outcomes (PLOs) – at least one, no more than 
four  – this information literacy instruction supports 
 
PLO1: Students will investigate differing viewpoints that they encounter in their strategic 
exploration of topics in order to be able to develop their own informed arguments or hypotheses. 
 
PLO2: Students will gain insight and understanding about diverse sources of information in 
order to evaluate and use resources appropriately for their information needs. 
 
PLO3: Students will identify the appropriate level of scholarship among publication types 
(scholarly journals, trade publications, magazines, websites, etc.) in order to critically evaluate 
the usefulness of the information for their research need. 
 
PLO6: Students will properly distinguish between their own ideas and the intellectual property of 
others in order to ethically use information and demonstrate academic integrity. 


